Malachy Walsh and Partners

Vi1l

Cork » Tralee & Limerick < London

Park House | Mahon Technology Park | Besshoro Road | Blackrock | Cork | Ireland
T 021 4536400 F 021 4536450 | Email: info@mwp.ie | Web: www.mwp.ie

Ref. MOS/16341
29th March 2016

Office of Climate, Licensing & Resource Use
EPA Headquarters PO Box 3000
Johnstown Castle Estate

Co. Wexford

Re: Waste Licence Application for Bantry Inner Harbour Develgpment Phase 1
%)

Dear Sir/Madam, o*@ @

o??’

Please find enclosed a waste licence appllcatlon m)(ékatmn to the Bantry Inner Harbour Development

Phase 1. &é)’\ ®§
The application comprises; \0 N
& A‘

e 1 signed original and 2 copéés of the waste licence application form and supporting

attachments.
e 2 copies of these files on‘%ﬁfﬁ
e 16 copies of the EISon C

e Details of application fee payment Ref PO SP020160300021

If you have any queries please contact the undersigned.

Yours sincerely

AN
=1 =

Michael O’'Shea ‘\

For Malachy Walsh and Partners
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S

psatae Séamus Kelly B.E., C.Eng., F.LE.l, R.Cons.EL | Jack O Leary M.E., C.Eng., F.LE.I, R.Cons.El | Peter O' Donnell B.E., C.Eng., M..C.E. F.LE.I.

r;;u Paul Collins B.E., C.Eng., M.LE.L, MStructE | Declan Cremen B.E (.Eng M.LE.L MIStructE | Peter Fay B.5cEng., DipEng., C.Eng., MLLE.L, MIStructE
= LREEGK ) ENGINEERS
@ Michael J. OSullivan B.E., C.Eng., M.LE.L, MCIWEM | Sean Doyle B.E., <. Eng...'M EL. | John Lee . E., C.Eng., MLEL | Neilus Hut B.E., C.Eng., M.LE.L., MCIBSE IRELAND
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Gillian O'Leaﬂ

From: Gillian O'Leary

Sent: 29 March 2016 11:38

To: Henry Kingston

Subject: FW: Application fee for a waste license for Bantry Dev.

From: Gillian O'Leary

Sent: 21 March 2016 14:49

To: 'P.KELLY@EPA.IF'

Subject: Application fee for a waste license for Bantry Dev.

Hi Pat,

Further to our telecom, the €10,000 payment is for waste licence application for Bantry Development. Reference
PO SP020160300021.

Please let me know if you require anything further.
Gill &

Gillian O'Leary 6‘@
FINANCE DEPARTMENT o??,
Port of Cork Company R
Custom House Street Q&
Cork Q}é\o\&\
Direct Phone: 00 353 21 4625315 BN
Email: goleary@portofcork.ie Q(’\QA‘\
WEB: www.portofcork.ie S 4

g5 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail
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MEMORANDUM
TO: FINANCE DEPT.,
FROM: ENGINEERING SERVICES DEPT.
DATE: 4TH MARCH 2016

SUBJECT: EFT REQUIRED FOR EPA

Please arrange bank transfer in the amount of €10,000.00 made payable to Environmental
Protection (as per the attached) as part of an application few for a waste license for the
Bantry development.

CODE: Z24/190

@

Thanks & regards,

M w
Denis Healy,
Manager Engineering Service
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