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Tibohine, 
Castlerea, 
Co.Roscommon. 
14-6-20 10 

To whom it Concerns, 
My name is Alison Kerrane,I am 16 years old and I live 

in Tibohine,Castlerea,Co.Roscommon. I am writing this e-mail in 
total and utter disgust after attending a meeting in the local 
community center Saturday night( 12'6'1 0) to discuss the proposed 
waste plant/Biopark, AD Power Ltd are intending on developing in 
the area. It is my strong opinion that this sort of industry SHOULD 
NOT be allowed into our community. Is it even correct to call 
Tibohine a community anymore? I regret to say I don't think so, I 
believe that our community will never be the same again. This 
proposed development has divided our community and its a sad 
thing to see in this day and age but its at times like this you begin 
to see peoples true colours. In fact they boldly stated in last week's 
Roscommon Hearld that they are adamant that development will 
go ahead with or without the support of the Tibohine people. 
Where is the sense of community in that? They don't care about the 
people of Tibohine and they treat our concerns as a joke. They had 
the cheek to laugh in my cousin's face Saturday night at the 
meeting when she put a question to them. The community spirit in 
the area is well and truly gone, and it's sickening to see. Claims 
that The Action Group are scare mongering and spreading fear and 
innuendo, are total lies. We aren't the ones who kept this 
development so hush-hush. It is my opinion that we were kept so 
in the dark in the hope that we'd sit back and take it, allow the 
wool to be pulled over our eyes and be used as guinea pigs, well 
the were mistaken weren't they. We were even told at the meeting 
that people in Swanlinbar had been told that the Roscommon 
people had embraced the idea. Well I can certainly say we have not 
embraced a waste plant in our village, and who in their right mid 
would. For my Junior Cert C.S.P.E last year I learned that "eve~y 
cornminip nceds certain people to muke szir-e thuf if is a good 
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place in which to live" and I admire Tibohine Action Group for all 
their hard work because at least if everything goes ahead, at least 
they can hold their heads high and say they did all they could, with 
minimal support. Its a sad thing to see your neighbours more 
interested in seeing how they could benefit money wise, from this 
development rather than supporting their neighbours, its a disgrace 
quite frankly in my eyes. 3 people from Swanlinbar attended the 
meeting, telling of how they fought to save their community and 
highlighting the facts about such a development. Isn't it a sad state 
of affairs when outsiders are more concerned about preserving the 
natural beauty of Tibohine in comparison to some locals? Some 
local residents were quite understandably appalled, astonished by 
the deceit of one neighbour in particular who has sold as he clearly 
admitted last night, the site the proposed industry will be 
developed on. A lot of questions were fobbed off with him 
choosing which to answer and blithering nonsense about heat. He 
avoided the questions he quite clearly did not have the answers to. 
I must admit, they did themselves no favours by muddling up 
information about water and hygiene, it was a total disgrace. 
Instead they (Kevin Flynn and Tony Dineen{ADPower}) kept 
reiterating the fact that they could guarantee that here would be no 
smell. Nobody can guarantee that, absolutely nobody because 
nobody knows what the future holds. After all, the Titanic was 
supposed to be unsinkable and look how that ended up. Nobody 
should make promises that they are not in a position to keep. What 
if one of the lorries, God forbid, turns over and waste is emitted 
from the tank, who can say then that there isn't going to be a smell? 
Absolutely nobody, and that I'm sure of. Tony Dineen swore blind 
last night that 12 traffic movements would take place to and from 
the plant after they stated 8 in the Environmental Impact statement- 
a bit of an inadequacy there isn't there, and if they got wrong how 
the hell are we supposed to believe a thing the say. How could 
anyone in their right frame of mind and with any consideration for 
children in particular allow such a development roughly about 100 
yards from Tibohine National School to get the go ahead? Nobody 
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was there to represent the school at the meeting, but surely the 
need to take action before its too late. What kind of education are 
children going to receive with an industry operating across from 
the school all day, everyday? The windows and doors will have to 
be sealed everyday to block out fumes and noise. Playtime will be 
ruined for the children with the smells and the noises impacting 
severely on them. This SHOULD NOT UNDER ANY 
CIRCUMSTANCES BE ALLOWED TO HAPPEN. From articles 
I've read on the internet I understand that such a development has 
already been rejected in Waterford because Rapeseed production 
was going to pose respiratory problems to Horses! We can only 
begin to imagine the long-term implications this Biopark or waste 
treatment plant will have on our health. Actually I'm confused as to 
why it's being called a Biopark when in actual fact it will be 
dealing predominantly with waste?! Also I, as the next generation 
of residents in the village, I have grave concerns that when this 
plant is up and running there is absolutely nothing to stop AD 
Power from selling this proposed plant 12months or whatever 
down the line and the plant being turned lOO%into dealing with 
waste. There is no doubt but this is probably happen because there 
is no resources around here for renewable energy and the land can 
barley grow a good harvest of grass let alone rapeseed. I also have 
concerns about rapeseed because it appears it impacts severely on 
asthma and hay fever sufferers. If health problems in horses got 
that particular application rejected surely there is no 
way permission could be granted for a development with such 
close proximity to a school full of vulnerable children. The 
development of such a plant would be more suited to a boggy area 
where there is an absence of human and animal habitation, and 
- NOT in the heart of a village surrounded by a large residential 
area, school, church and community centre which most certainly is 
not the place for it under any circumstances. It inhriates me to 
think that by this time next year the Tibohine I was born and raised 
in may be drastically different. I ask myself at this point how has 
planning gotten so far when the local community were kept so in 
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the dark? Surely that's a sign that they wanted to avoid opposition. 
Tibohine is a beautifully serene area with breathtaking views of the 
surrounding countryside in particular LoughGara Lake. What kind 
of view are we going to have with a factory operating 24/7 in our 
village? Not a very pleasant one I can imagine. The proposed 
factory will be just of the main N5 Dublin road connecting the 
village to the local town of Ballaghaderreen. Traffic is already 
heavy enough and any further contribution to traffic problems will 
be most unwelcome. On May 1st of this year the traffic jams into 
Ballaghaderreen due to a fair were enormous. The likes of it I have 
certainly never seen in a rural area and the town wasn't prepared to 
cope with the severity of the traffic. An increase in lorries into the 
area certainly will not be welcomed particularly at peak times. The 
factory will be located in close proximity to a very dangerous bend 
which is prone to traffic accidents and has even seen a fatality. The 
lives of local residents should not under any circumstances be put 
in danger. I, along with countless amounts of others use this road 
each day to attend school in Ballaghaderreen and the last thing we 
want is to be stuck behind lorries transporting waste material into 
the area each day. I'm sure the same applies to so many more that 
use the road for travel and work, after all the N5 connects the West 
of Ireland with Dublin. This road is busy enough as it is and excess 
traffic can only do more harm than good. On local radio Mid-West 
on Friday the 21st of May the news department attempted to 
contact the contractors several times but to no avail. Why, I ask? 
What have they to hide? Then they had the audacity to say in the 
Roscommon Hearld that nobody had bothered to lift the phone and 
contact them, more lies it seems. Another thing I have a major 
issue with is the fact that they applied for the waste licenses in the 
Irish Times. Nobody in this area buys the Irish Times on a daily 
basis, if ever even; the local shop doesn't even sell it. This was an 
issue that affects the people of Tibohine and it should have 
therefore been circulated in the local papers and they should have 
made sure that the full details of the plant were made known to 
everybody. There was a lot of cover-ups here in my opinion to 
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avoid conflict and opposition. Its not a very good example to be 
setting to the next generation is it, especially considering the lies 
and deceit we hear about everyday on the news,this just brings it 
closer to home. There are a number of people outraged at this 
proposed development, and rightly so, Tibohine does not need this 
BioPark, we've managed without it in the past and we'll surely 
manage without it in the future. How can something that is 
generating so much conflict in the locality be good for our 
community? I'm on summer holidays from school for nearly a 
month now and so far all I've been doing is my bit to help the 
opposition and I intend to keep fighting to ensure that the Tibohine 
I know and love and grew up in will be the very same for all the 
next generations to come. As I said this has divided our community 
and it is not therefore, under any circumstances good for our 
community. It is for all the reasons mentioned above, and so many, 
many more that I implore to you, because you have the final say, 
please help us to stop this. We are the fbture and we need do 
ensure the fbture is bright. I appeal to you with all my heart to 
reject the waste licenses; you have the power so please use it. I 
would be grateful for a reply to this e-mail to acknowledge that my 
efforts have not been in vain. Thank You for taking the time to 
read this. 

An unhappy resident, 
ALkh4/7CeuuclMR. 
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Tibohine, 
Castlerea, 
Co .Roscommon. 
14-6-20 10 

To whom it Concerns, 
My name is Alison Kerrane,I am 16 years old and I live 

in Tibohine,Castlerea,Co.Roscommon. I am writing this e-mail in 
total and utter disgust after attending a meeting in the local 
community center Saturday night( 12'6' 10) to discuss the proposed 
waste plant/Biopark, AD Power Ltd are intending on developing in 
the area. It is my strong opinion that this sort of industry SHOULD 
NOT be allowed into our community. Is it even correct to call 
Tibohine a community anymore? I regret to say I don't think so, I 
believe that our community will never be the same again. This 
proposed development has divided our community and its a sad 
thing to see in this day and age but its at times like this you begin 
to see peoples true colours. In fact they boldly stated in last week's 
Roscommon Hearld that they are adamant that development will 
go ahead with or without the support of the Tibohine people. 
Where is the sense of community in that? They don't care about the 
people of Tibohine and they treat our concerns as a joke. They had 
the cheek to laugh in my cousin's face Saturday night at the 
meeting when she put a question to them. The community spirit in 
the area is well and truly gone, and it's sickening to see. Claims 
that The Action Group are scare mongering and spreading fear and 
innuendo, are total lies. We aren't the ones who kept this 
development so hush-hush. It is my opinion that we were kept so 
in the dark in the hope that we'd sit back and take it, allow the 
wool to be pulled over our eyes and be used as guinea pigs, well 
the were mistaken weren't they. We were even told at the meeting 
that people in Swanlinbar had been told that the Roscommon 
people had embraced the idea. Well I can certainly say we have not 
embraced a waste plant in our village, and who in their right mid 
would. For my Junior Cert C.S.P.E last year I learned that "every 
commiini[\) needs certnin people to muke srir-e that it is LI good 
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place in which to live" and I admire Tibohine Action Group for all 
their hard work because at least if everything goes ahead, at least 
they can hold their heads high and say they did all they could, with 
minimal support. Its a sad thing to see your neighbours more 
interested in seeing how they could benefit money wise, from this 
development rather than supporting their neighbours, its a disgrace 
quite frankly in my eyes. 3 people from Swanlinbar attended the 
meeting, telling of how they fought to save their community and 
highlighting the facts about such a development. Isn't it a sad state 
of affairs when outsiders are more concerned about preserving the 
natural beauty of Tibohine in comparison to some locals? Some 
local residents were quite understandably appalled, astonished by 
the deceit of one neighbour in particular who has sold as he clearly 
admitted last night, the site the proposed industry will be 
developed on. A lot of questions were fobbed off with him 
choosing which to answer and blithering nonsense about heat. He 
avoided the questions he quite clearly did not have the answers to. 
I must admit, they did themselves no favours by muddling up 
information about water and hygiene, it was a total disgrace. 
Instead they (Kevin Flynn and Tony Dineen ( ADPower}) kept 
reiterating the fact that they could guarantee that here would be no 
smell. Nobody can guarantee that, absolutely nobody because 
nobody knows what the future holds. After all, the Titanic was 
supposed to be unsinkable and look how that ended up. Nobody 
should make promises that they are not in a position to keep. What 
if one of the lorries, God forbid, turns over and waste is emitted 
from the tank, who can say then that there isn't going to be a smell? 
Absolutely nobody, and that I'm sure of. Tony Dineen swore blind 
last night that 12 traffic movements would take place to and from 
the plant after they stated 8 in the Environmental Impact statement- 
a bit of an inadequacy there isn't there, and if they got wrong how 
the hell are we supposed to believe a thing the say. How could 
anyone in their right frame of mind and with any consideration for 
children in particular allow such a development roughly about 100 
yards from Tibohine National School to get the go ahead? Nobody 
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was there to represent the school at the meeting, but surely the 
need to take action before its too late. What kind of education are 
children going to receive with an industry operating across from 
the school all day, everyday? The windows and doors will have to 
be sealed everyday to block out fumes and noise. Playtime will be 
ruined for the children with the smells and the noises impacting 
severely on them. This SHOULD NOT UNDER ANY 
CIRCUMSTANCES BE ALLOWED TO HAPPEN. From articles 
I've read on the internet I understand that such a development has 
already been rejected in Waterford because Rapeseed production 
was going to pose respiratory problems to Horses! We can only 
begin to imagine the long-term implications this Biopark or waste 
treatment plant will have on our health. Actually I'm confused as to 
why it's being called a Biopark when in actual fact it will be 
dealing predominantly with waste?! Also I, as the next generation 
of residents in the village, I have grave concerns that when this 
plant is up and running there is absolutely nothing to stop AD 
Power from selling this proposed plant 12months or whatever 
down the line and the plant being turned 100%into dealing with 
waste. There is no doubt but this is probably happen because there 
is no resources around here for renewable energy and the land can 
barley grow a good harvest of grass let alone rapeseed. I also have 
concerns about rapeseed because it appears it impacts severely on 
asthma and hay fever sufferers. If health problems in horses got 
that particular application rejected surely there is no 
way permission could be granted for a development with such 
close proximity to a school full of vulnerable children. The 
development of such a plant would be more suited to a boggy area 
where there is an absence of human and animal habitation, and 
- NOT in the heart of a village surrounded by a large residential 
area, school, church and community centre which most certainly is 
not the place for it under any circumstances. It inhriates me to 
think that by this time next year the Tibohine I was born and raised 
in may be drastically different. I ask myself at this point how has 
planning gotten so far when the local community were kept so in 
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the dark? Surely that's a sign that they wanted to avoid opposition. 
Tibohine is a beautifully serene area with breathtaking views of the 
surrounding countryside in particular LoughGara Lake. What kind 
of view are we going to have with a factory operating 24/7 in our 
village? Not a very pleasant one I can imagine. The proposed 
factory will be just of the main N5 Dublin road connecting the 
village to the local town of Ballaghaderreen. Traffic is already 
heavy enough and any further contribution to traffic problems will 
be most unwelcome. On May 1st of this year the traffic jams into 
Ballaghaderreen due to a fair were enormous. The likes of it I have 
certainly never seen in a rural area and the town wasn't prepared to 
cope with the severity of the traffic. An increase in lorries into the 
area certainly will not be welcomed particularly at peak times. The 
factory will be located in close proximity to a very dangerous bend 
which is prone to traffic accidents and has even seen a fatality. The 
lives of local residents should not under any circumstances be put 
in danger. I, along with countless amounts of others use this road 
each day to attend school in Ballaghaderreen and the last thing we 
want is to be stuck behind lorries transporting waste material into 
the area each day. I'm sure the same applies to so many more that 
use the road for travel and work, after all the N5 connects the West 
of Ireland with Dublin. This road is busy enough as it is and excess 
traffic can only do more harm than good. On local radio Mid-West 
on Friday the 2 1 st of May the news department attempted to 
contact the contractors several times but to no avail. Why, I ask? 
What have they to hide? Then they had the audacity to say in the 
Roscommon Hearld that nobody had bothered to lift the phone and 
contact them, more lies it seems. Another thing I have a major 
issue with is the fact that they applied for the waste licenses in the 
Irish Times. Nobody in this area buys the Irish Times on a daily 
basis, if ever even; the local shop doesn't even sell it. This was an 
issue that affects the people of Tibohine and it should have 
therefore been circulated in the local papers and they should have 
made sure that the full details of the plant were made known to 
everybody. There was a lot of cover-ups here in my opinion to 
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avoid conflict and opposition. Its not a very good example to be 
setting to the next generation is it, especially considering the lies 
and deceit we hear about everyday on the news,this just brings it 
closer to home. There are a number of people outraged at this 
proposed development, and rightly so, Tibohine does not need this 
BioPark, we've managed without it in the past and we'll surely 
manage without it in the future. How can something that is 
generating so much conflict in the locality be good for our 
community? I'm on summer holidays from school for nearly a 
month now and so far all I've been doing is my bit to help the 
opposition and I intend to keep fighting to ensure that the Tibohine 
I know and love and grew up in will be the very same for all the 
next generations to come. As I said this has divided our community 
and it is not therefore, under any circumstances good for our 
community. It is for all the reasons mentioned above, and so many, 
many more that I implore to you, because you have the final say, 
please help us to stop this. We are the future and we need do 
ensure the future is bright. I appeal to you with all my heart to 
reject the waste licenses; you have the power so please use it. I 
would be grateful for a reply to this e-mail to acknowledge that my 
efforts have not been in vain. Thank You for taking the time to 
read this. 

An unhappy resident, 
A l i a s n / K w v w  
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