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Dear Sirs, 

to do so will CO o present problems 

Associates: 7. Cannon 
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The IDA is currently in the process of preparing an application for a discharge licence for 
the discharge from the WWTP on the site, as requested by Wicklow Co.Co. 
Correspondence dated 30th October 2007. It is of particular concern to the IDA that the 
€PA is proposing to grant permission for emissions from the Vitra site into the IDA WWTP, 
which the IDA will have no control over. 

I 
II 

Should there be any breach of these limits, the IDA will be held responsible, due to the 
fact that they will be the holder of the discharge license from the site, but they will have no 
control over the influent quality. 

Given these concerns we request the EPA; seek clarification from Wicklow Co. Co., that a 
discharge license would be granted to the IDA, for the WWTP effluent, with the indicated 
concentrations, quoted in the proposed decision. Further we request the EPA; seek 
clarification from Vitra (Ireland) Ltd. on how the discharge quality is to be achieved, and 
we also request that the EPA revise the limits to levels equivalent to domestic sewage. 

Until this is resolved to the satisfaction of the IDA, we feel it necessary to object to the 
proposed decision. 

Yours Sincerely, 

David Conneran 
Associate 
For and on behalf of TOBIN Consulting Engineers 

Template lei 004 

    
    

    
    

    
For

 in
sp

ec
tio

n p
ur

po
se

s o
nly

.

Con
se

nt 
of

 co
py

rig
ht 

ow
ne

r r
eq

uir
ed

 fo
r a

ny
 ot

he
r u

se
.

EPA Export 26-07-2013:00:13:25



r Page 1 of2 

Joe Reilly 

From: Noeleen Keavey 

Sent: 03 April 2008 08:46 

To: Joe Reilly 

Subject: FW: Licence Register PO823-01 

Attachments: S45C-108040213050.pdf 

Joe 

Another objection for Vitra - check with Ann to see if they paid fee by credit card - if not its invalid ! 

Noeleen 

From: Debbie Farmer [mailto:Debbie.Farmer@tobin.ie] 
Sent: 02 April 2008 14:09 
To: Noeleen Keavey 
Subject: Re: Licence Register PO823-01 

Good Afternoon, 

Please find attached for your information. 

Kind regards, 

Debbie Farmer. 

Debbie Farmer (Accounts Assistant) 

TOBIN Consulting Engineers 

Blanchardstown Corporate Park 
Dublin 15, Ireland 
Phone: +353 (0) 1 80304 06 
Fax: +353 (0) 1 80304 09 
E mail: debbie.farmer@tobin.ie 

Block 10-4 

TOBIN Consulting Engineers: Engineers Ireland CPD Company of the Year Winner 2007 

Disclaimer 
“This email is confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the 
intended recipient, be advised that you have received this email in error and that any use, dissemination, forwarding, 
printing, or copying of this email is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error please contact the sender and 
destroy this email. Any views or opinions presented are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those 
of TOBIN. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defects, which might 
affect any computer or IT system into which they are received, no responsibility is accepted by TOBIN for any loss or 
damage arising in any way from the receipt or use thereof‘ 

03/04/2008 
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Patrick J TOBIN & Co. Ltd is a company with limited liability, registered in Galway, Ireland. 
Registered Number 042654. Registered Office is Fairgreen House, Fairgreen Road, Galway. 

This email has been scanned by the MessageLabs Email Security System. 
For more information please visit http://www.messagelabs.com/email 

03/04/2008 
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